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While sustainability has always 
been of the Company’s ethos, 
during the year HPL formalised 
its commitment to embedding 
ESG considerations across its 
operations through the formulation 
of an ESG Framework that targets 
and action plans to align the 
Company's sustainability strategy 
with its overall business goals. 
This framework was developed 
with a deep understanding of 
HPL’s operational and decision-
making needs as well as 
emerging sustainability risks and 
opportunities which are becoming 
increasingly pronounced in our 
operating landscape. 

OUR APPROACH
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The Company’s ESG roadmap is aligned with “Hayleys Lifecode”, the Hayleys Group’s holistic ESG roadmap.  The plan acts as a guide for 
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Priority area SDGs 2030 Target
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ESG GOVERNANCE

ESG STEERING COMMITTEE

Objective

Meetings

Composition

The HPL Board’s role on ESG

HPL Board of Directors Hayleys Board of Directors

HPL’s ESG Steering 
Committee

Group ESG Steering 
Committee

Sustainability Team – 
Lifecode Champion 

Group ESG

Estate Level


